

Customer Quote Document

ARROW ELECTRONICS UK LTD

London Road Campus

London Road HARLOW CM17 9NA

UNITED KINGDOM

Telephone: +44(0)1279455300 Fax: +44(0)1279455477

Internet: www.arrowuk.com

Customer UNIVERSITY COLLEGE LONDON

Customer RFQ Number Martin

Freight Terms PREPAID-FLAT

Shipping Method GENERIC-TL-STD 48 HOURS

Payment Terms 30 EOM Indexation NO

Bill to 2027654

LONDON CENTRE FOR NANOTECHNOLOGY 17-19 GORDON STREET

LONDON LONDON WC1H OAH UNITED

KINGDOM

Arrow Quote No.

 Quote Date
 05.08.2010

 Quote Expiration Date
 04.09.2010

 Quote Total
 364.80

 Currency
 GBP

Field Contact Internal Contact

Ship to

2052072

THE ROYAL INSTITUTION OF GREAT BRITAIN

21 ALBEMARLE STREET

LONDON LONDON W1S 4BS UNITED

KINGDOM

20087918

1.1 192 ICS581G-01LF IDT 1.9000 EA 364.80 9 192 EACH 96 ZERO DELAY PLL CLOCK MULTIPLEXER SINGLE 6MHZ TO 200MHZ 16-PIN TSSOP TUBE ROHS: RHC ECCN (US Re-Export): EAR99 ECCN (Local): NLR Tariff Code: 385423990 Tariff Code Description: Other electronic integrated circuits Ex. Rate: Based on 1 GBP = 1.59415741187832 USD 2.1 1 NO BID MISCA 0.00000 EA 0.00 20 1 EACH 1 NO BID -UNABLE TO OFFER!. ROHS: RHC ECCN (US Re-Export): EAR99 ECCN (Local): NLR ICS527R-01 PART OBSOLETE. Tariff Code: 49019900 Tariff Code Description: Printed books, brochures, leaflets and similar printed matter	Line	QTY	Customer Part Number	Part Number	Manufacturer	Resale GBP	UOM	Line Total GBP	Lead Time (Weeks)	Arrow Promise Date	MOQ	PK	PK QTY
RoHS: RHC ECCN (US Re-Export): EAR99 ECCN (Local): NLR Tariff Code: 85423990 Tariff Code Description: Other electronic integrated circuits Ex. Rate: Based on 1 GBP = 1.59415741187832 USD 2.1 1 NO BID MISCA 0.0000 EA 0.00 20 1 EACH 1 NO BID -UNABLE TO OFFER!. RoHS: RHC ECCN (US Re-Export): EAR99 ECCN (Local): NLR ICSS27R-01 PART OBSOLETE. Tariff Code: 49019900	1.1	192		ICS581G-01LF	IDT	1.90000	EA	364.80	9		192	EACH	96
NO BID -UNABLE TO OFFER!. RoHS: RHC ECCN (US Re-Export): EAR99 ECCN (Local): NLR ICS527R-01 PART OBSOLETE. Tariff Code:49019900				RoHS: RHC ECCN (US Re-Export): EAR99 ECCN (Local): NLR Tariff Code: 85423990 Tariff Code Description: Other electron Ex. Rate: Based on 1 GBP = 1.594157	ic integrated circuits		IN TSSOP	TUBE					
	2.1	1		NO BID -UNABLE TO OFFER!. RoHS: RHC ECCN (US Re-Export): EAR99 ECCN (Local): NLR ICS527R-01 PART OBSOLETE. Tariff Code:49019900				0.00	20		1	EACH	1



Customer Quote Document

Terms and conditions:

Our Standard Terms and Conditions apply, copies may be found at Web site http://www.arrowuk.com/about/uk/terms/terms.doc, from the sender, or as stated in a signed contract. Any information given relating to Lead Free and /or RoHS status of any product is based upon manufacturer's data and is passed on in good faith and is given without responsibility or liability. It is the user's responsibility to verify any information with the Manufacturer before relying on it.

This quotation is subject to our Standard Terms & Condition of Sale and is valid at the time of quotation.